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 Chart topping-and headline-making-rap artist Eminem shares his private reflections, drawings,
handwritten lyrics, and photographs in his New York Times bestseller The Way I Am

Fiercely intelligent, relentlessly provocative, and prodigiously gifted, Eminem is known as much for his
enigmatic persona as for being the fastest-selling rap artist and the first rapper to ever win an Oscar.
Everyone wants to know what Eminem is really like-after the curtains go down. In The Way I Am, Eminem
writes candidly, about how he sees the world. About family and friends; about hip-hop and rap battles and
his searing rhymes; about the conflicts and challenges that have made him who he is today.

Illustrated with more than 200 full-color and black-and-white photographs-including family snapshots and
personal Polaroids, it is a visual self-portrait that spans the rapper's entire life and career, from his early
childhood in Missouri to the basement home studio he records in today, from Detroit's famous Hip Hop Shop
to sold-out arenas around the globe. Readers who have wondered at Em's intricate, eye- opening rhyme
patterns can also see, first-hand, the way his mind works in dozens of reproductions of his original lyric
sheets, written in pen, on hotel stationary, on whatever scrap of paper was at hand. These lyric sheets,
published for the first time here, show uncut genius at work. Taking readers deep inside his creative process,
Eminem reckons with the way that chaos and controversy have fueled his music and helped to give birth to
some of his most famous songs (including "Stan," "Without Me," and "Lose Yourself").

Providing a personal tour of Eminem's creative process, The Way I Am has been hailed as "fascinating,"
"compelling," and "candid."
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From reader reviews:

Robin Curtin:

The book The Way I Am make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot
more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem using your
subject. If you can make looking at a book The Way I Am being your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able
to know everything if you like open and read a guide The Way I Am. Kinds of book are several. It means
that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

George Seal:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what kind you should start with. This The Way I Am is our recommendation so you keep up with the
world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Brooks Davis:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you read a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics,
along with soon. The The Way I Am will give you new experience in looking at a book.

David Scott:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. Through the book The Way I Am we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative
people? Being creative person must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that acceptable with your
aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book The Way I Am. You can more pleasing than
now.
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