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Politics and Suicide argues that whilst the historical lineage of suicidal politics is recognised, the
fundamental significance of autodestruction to the political remains under examined. It contends that
practices like suicide-bombing do not simply embody a strange or abnormal ‘suicidal’ articulation of the
political, but rather, that the existence of suicidal politics tells us something fundamental about the political
as such and thinking about political violence more broadly.

Recent world events have emphatically shown our need for tools with which to develop better
understandings of the politics of suicide. Through the exploration of several arresting case-studies, including
the ‘Kamikaze’ bombers of World War Two, Jan Palach’s self-immolation in 1969, Cold War nuclear
deterrence, and the suicide-terrorist attacks of 9/11 Michelsen asks how we might talk of a political suicide
in any of these contexts. The book charts how political processes ‘go suicidal’, and asks how we might still
consider them to be political in such a case. It investigates how suicide can function as ‘politics’.

A strong contribution to the fields of philosophy and international relations theory, this work will also be of
interest to students and scholars of political theory and terrorism & political violence.
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From reader reviews:

Alexander Ratcliff:

This Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of political self-destruction (Interventions) book is simply not
ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book
is definitely information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of
political self-destruction (Interventions) without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of political self-
destruction (Interventions) can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn
out to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Politics and
Suicide: The philosophy of political self-destruction (Interventions) having very good arrangement in word
and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Clifford Jones:

Typically the book Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of political self-destruction (Interventions) will
bring you to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very
unique. Should you try to find new book you just read, this book very ideal to you. The book Politics and
Suicide: The philosophy of political self-destruction (Interventions) is much recommended to you to read.
You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Lisa Lee:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill
your free time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you
want to try out look for book, may be the book untitled Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of political self-
destruction (Interventions) can be fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Susan Arnold:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work here
is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside search likes.
Maybe you answer can be Politics and Suicide: The philosophy of political self-destruction (Interventions)
why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual.
The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
guide you to pick up this book.
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