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For some, the song of America is an anthem, exalting the fabled American Dream; for others, it is a funeral
dirge for a dream indefinitely deferred. Yet, from the optimism of Emma Lazarus's The New Colossus to the
disenchantment of Paul Laurence Dunbar's We Wear the Mask, the diverse and sometimes dissonant voices
in this collection combine to form an eclectic collage of American poetry.

This anthology explores a wide range of themes, many universal and some uniquely American; ruminations
on beauty and grief can be found alongside thoughts on bigotry, Buffalo Bill, the birth of a nation, and the
death of Kurt Cobain. This patchwork of American poetry is as diverse and multifaceted as the country itself.

This Prestwick House Literary Touchstone Classic includes a glossary and notes to help readers understand
and appreciate the nuances of the poems in this collection.
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Dews:

The book Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others
gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more
increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem along with your
subject. If you can make looking at a book Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land,
Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others to be your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your capable,
increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You may know everything if you like wide open and
read a publication Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and
99 Others. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other individuals. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Tom Copper:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride,
and 99 Others book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the details here
are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to
give to you. The writer regarding Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul
Revere's Ride, and 99 Others content conveys the thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed
and e-book are not different in the information but it just different as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking
Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Bernice King:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read one with
theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Great American Poems: The Road Not Taken,
The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Robert Mills:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book and also novel and Great American Poems: The Road
Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others or maybe others sources were given



expertise for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science
guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to include their
knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Great American Poems: The Road
Not Taken, The Waste Land, Paul Revere's Ride, and 99 Others to make your spare time far more colorful.
Many types of book like this one.
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