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The Little Book of Legs

The Little Book of Legs
Get your kicks for less!
Legs, legs, and more legs for a song
 
Many loved The Big Book of Legs but some found it just too darn big, weighing in at nearly seven pounds.
True, it was packed with shapely legs spanning six decades, from the first shy emergence of the ankle in the
1910s, through the rolled stockings and rouged knees of the 1920s, to the Betty Grable ’40s, the stockinged
and stilettoed ’50s, on into the sexually liberated ’60s and ’70s, but it could still put a dent in your own
thighs if you sat reading for too long.

Fortunately here at TASCHEN we listen to your groans of agony as well as your moans of ecstasy; thus, the
light and portable Little Book of Legs, packing over 100 of the choicest photos from the original volume, as
well as 38 new photos, into a compact (and frankly adorable) package. From Betty Grable to Bettie Page,
the greatest legs of the 20th Century can be found within, shot by Irving Klaw, Bunny Yeager, and the
incomparable Elmer Batters, father of leg art. There are silk and nylon stockings, high heels in abundance,
curvy calves, taut thighs, playful toes and towering arches—with no bothersome text to get in the way. Could
leg love get any sweeter?
 
Text in English, French, and German
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Dudley:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what
kind of e-book you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense
happy read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The particular The Little Book of Legs
is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Randy Garrison:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Little Book of Legs can be good book to read. May be it is
usually best activity to you.

Rick Fountain:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes examining, not
only science book and also novel and The Little Book of Legs as well as others sources were given expertise
for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science guide
was created for teacher or students especially. Those publications are helping them to increase their
knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The Little Book of Legs to make
your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Robert Hansen:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or
even make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or
real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that
on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Little Book of Legs can make you experience more interested to read.
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