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This is the first comparative, cross-national study of the participation of women in the armed forces of
NATO countries. Along side an analysis of this key topic stands a critique of existing theoretical models and
the proposal of a revised analytical framework.

Unlike previous works this new study employs mixed-methodological research design combining
quantitative and qualitative data - a large N-analysis based on general policies and statistical information
concerning every country in the sample with more in-depth case-studies.

This volume includes original empirical data regarding the presence of women in the armed forces of NATO
countries, proposes an index of ‘gender inclusiveness’ and assesses the factors that affect women’s military
roles. The book also presents two new key case studies – Portugal and the Netherlands - based on both
documentary sources and in-depth interviews of both men and women officers in the two countries.

This book will be of great interest to all students and scholars of strategic studies, gender and women studies
and military history.
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From reader reviews:

Tessie Springfield:

This Gender and the Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military
Studies) book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain
by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is
getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Gender and the Military:
Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military Studies) without we know teach
the one who examining it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Gender and the
Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military Studies) can bring any
time you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it inside
your lovely laptop even phone. This Gender and the Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western
Democracies (Routledge Military Studies) having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will
not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Velma Cain:

The publication with title Gender and the Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies
(Routledge Military Studies) includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after
read this book. This book exist new expertise the information that exist in this reserve represented the
condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This
specific book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your
smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Morris Reyna:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled
Gender and the Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military Studies)
your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe not known
for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one type
conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The Gender and the Military: Women
in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military Studies) giving you yet another
experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful information for your better life
within this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will be pleased when
you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out
spare time activity?

Gary Lopez:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific Gender and the Military: Women in the



Armed Forces of Western Democracies (Routledge Military Studies) can give you a lot of buddies because
by you looking at this one book you have thing that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting
person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that
maybe your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than different make you to be great persons. So , why
hesitate? We need to have Gender and the Military: Women in the Armed Forces of Western Democracies
(Routledge Military Studies).
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