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The three shots fired into the back of Israel’s prime minister, Yitzhak Rabin, on the night of November 4,
1995, were a blow to Israel’s social body. The shock, horror, and pain caused by the murder found direct and
overwhelming expression at the funeral and memorial ceremonies held in Jerusalem, attended by most of the
world’s leaders.

This book deals with the social and political developments in Israel in the painful process of decolonization
from the occupied territories, following the late 1980s Palestinian Intifada and its aftermath. Fifteen
distinguished contributors from a range of disciplinary viewpoints—historical, psychological,
anthropological, political, and cultural—survey the various reactions to the assassination and analyze its
ramifications and repercussions, creating a powerful mosaic of Israel with the assassination at its center.

The fear that the murder would lead to civil war did not materialize. In fact, with hindsight it seems that the
prime minister was a scapegoat, a victim of a deeply divided society split not only over the issue of peace
with its neighbors but, more profoundly, over the construction of Israel’s collective identity and
consciousness. The assassination showed how easy it is for religious fundamentalists to ignore democratic
rules and how militant nationalists will resort to violence to prevent the surrender of parts of the Holy Land.

The strength of these elements of society was manifested in the general elections of 1996, when Rabin’s
adherents lost to the nationalist-clerical group. Paradoxically, the reaction to the assassination also revealed
Israel’s growing desire to pursue the peace process, and when Prime Minister Netanyahu failed to do so, he
was replaced before his term ended. Less than four years after the assassination, the Israelis put the reigns of
government back into the hands of Rabin’s successors, who promised to continue in his path.

With the road to peace lengthy, painful, and hazardous, have the fanatics learned a lesson from the aftermath
of Rabin’s murder? Will he be the last victim? Will Israeli democracy survive the agony of shrinking to the
tiny size of the pre-1967 boundaries? Will Israeli society develop into a Western democratic and enlightened
model, or will it become a reactionary, ethnocentric, xenophobic backwater? This volume does not propose
definitive answers to these questions, but it reflects on them in very thoughtful and knowledgeable ways.
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From reader reviews:

Eleanor Rowe:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every day to
reading a e-book. The book The Assassination of Yitzhak Rabin it is extremely good to read. There are a lot
of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did
not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to
read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Kellie Stephens:

The Assassination of Yitzhak Rabin can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The writer giving his/her
effort that will put every word into delight arrangement in writing The Assassination of Yitzhak Rabin but
doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe
you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into new stage of crucial considering.

Morris Sampson:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a book
you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply because book
has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have
read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The The
Assassination of Yitzhak Rabin provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Cherly Plaster:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This The Assassination of Yitzhak Rabin
is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not
have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier
to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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