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Anne of Green Gables is a bestselling series of books by Canadian author Lucy Maud Montgomery first
published in 1908. Originally written as fiction for readers of all ages, in recent decades they have been
considered a children's series.

Since publication, Anne of Green Gables has sold over 50 million books.

The three books in this edition,

Anne of Green Gables

Anne of Avonlea

Anne of the Island

are the first 3 volumes of the series and are the parts of the series most suited for young readers.
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From reader reviews:

Milford Garrett:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled Anne of Green Gables Boxed Set, Vol. 1 (Anne of Green
Gables, Anne of Avonlea, Anne of the Island). Try to make the book Anne of Green Gables Boxed Set, Vol.
1 (Anne of Green Gables, Anne of Avonlea, Anne of the Island) as your buddy. It means that it can to be
your friend when you experience alone and beside that course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very
fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know anything by
the book. So , let's make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Carol McElroy:

The publication untitled Anne of Green Gables Boxed Set, Vol. 1 (Anne of Green Gables, Anne of Avonlea,
Anne of the Island) is the guide that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide
content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of study when write the book, to ensure the information that they share
to your account is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Anne of Green Gables
Boxed Set, Vol. 1 (Anne of Green Gables, Anne of Avonlea, Anne of the Island) from the publisher to make
you considerably more enjoy free time.

Lillian Robbins:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended to you personally is Anne of Green Gables Boxed Set, Vol. 1 (Anne of Green Gables,
Anne of Avonlea, Anne of the Island) this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this
world now. This book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use
to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he makes this book. This is
why this book appropriate all of you.

Patrick Allen:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This e-book Anne of Green Gables Boxed Set, Vol. 1 (Anne of Green Gables, Anne of
Avonlea, Anne of the Island) was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge
about your technology competence. Some people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If



you know how big selling point of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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