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August 1939 was a time of great flux. The fear of impending war fueled by the aggression of Nazi Germany
forced many changes. Young people pursuing academic research were plunged into an entirely different kind
of research and development. For Bernard Lovell, the war meant involvement in one of the most vital
research projects of the war-radar.

Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar presents a passionate first-hand account of the development of the
Home Sweet Home (H2S) radar systems during World War II. The book provides numerous personal
insights into the scientific culture of wartime Britain and details the many personal sacrifices, setbacks, and
eventual triumphs made by those actively involved.

Bernard Lovell began his work on airborne interception radar in Taffy Bowen's airborne radar group. He was
involved in the initial development of the application of the 10 centimeter cavity magnetron to airborne radar
that revolutionized radar systems. In the autumn of 1941, the failure of Bomber Command to locate its target
over the cloudy skies of Europe prompted the formation of a new group to develop a blind bombing system.
Led by Lovell, this group developed the H2S radar system to identify towns and other targets at night or
during heavy cloud cover. H2S first saw operational use with the Pathfinder Squadrons in the attack on
Hamburg during the night of January 30-31, 1943. Two months later, modified H2S units installed in Coastal
Command aircraft operating over the Bay of Biscay had a dramatic tactical effect on the air war against U-
boats. The tide had begun to turn. In this fascinating chronicle of the H2S radar project, Sir Bernard Lovell
recreates the feel and mood of the wartime years.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Carter:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important usually. The book Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar had been
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The guide Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar is not only giving you much more
new information but also being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend
time to read your publication. Try to make relationship together with the book Echoes of War: The Story of
H2S Radar. You never really feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Edward Thompson:

The event that you get from Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar is a more deep you looking the
information that hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to recognise but Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar giving you buzz feeling of reading.
The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this
because the author of this book is well-known enough. That book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We suggest you for having that Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar instantly.

Joseph Cash:

The guide with title Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar has a lot of information that you can find out it.
You can get a lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in
this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to understand how
the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the globalization. You can read the
e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Erin Harmon:

The book untitled Echoes of War: The Story of H2S Radar contain a lot of information on that. The writer
explains her idea with easy means. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not
necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue reading your smart
phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.
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