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Victoria and Tony never understood their disapproving mother, Amanda, who even now offers them little
warmth. On her deathbed, Amanda extracts a promise from her daughter: She will guide Victoria on an
unexpected journey into her past if in return, Victoria helps her die with physician-assisted suicide. It begins
with a story that is unlike anything Victoria has heard before, where she will discover secrets so shocking, it
shakes the foundation of her family and changes her perception of who she believes she is. A captivating and
forbidden love story that spans almost fifty years and moves from war torn London to Auschwitz to the
United States emerges in a vividly emotional tale that brings one family together in ways that none could
have expected. As Victoria gets to know her mother’s story, Tony stumbles across letters written by his
father, Edward, and uncovers a truth so terrible that everything comes into question. After trying to escape
the shadow of his father’s death, Tony discovers a long-buried and shameful secret Edward had kept, causing
him to question the assumptions and expectations he’s made about his life and his family. When does a
moral choice become a moral imperative? And where does one draw the line between punishment,
forgiveness and mercy? Fault Line is an honest novel that explores the lengths we will go in order to protect
our family and to keep the past from dictating the future. Evocative, thought provoking, and uplifting; this is
the story that will stay with you long after the last page is turned.
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From reader reviews:

James Baron:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Fault Line (Uninvited Book 3). Try to make the book Fault
Line (Uninvited Book 3) as your friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone
and beside that course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book
makes you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to
make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Robert Densmore:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Fault Line (Uninvited
Book 3), you may enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Randy Anderson:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may doesn't work
the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be Fault Line (Uninvited Book 3) why because the
wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is
usually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this
book.

Carol Sage:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many
books in the top collection in your reading list is Fault Line (Uninvited Book 3). This book that is qualified
as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upwards and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.
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