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This book is structured as a step-by-step course of study along the lines of a VLSI integrated circuit design
project. The entire Verilog language is presented, from the basics to everything necessary for synthesis of an
entire 70,000 transistor, full-duplex serializer-deserializer, including synthesizable PLLs. The author
includes everything an engineer needs for in-depth understanding of the Verilog language: Syntax, synthesis
semantics, simulation and test. Complete solutions for the 27 labs are provided in the downloadable files that
accompany the book. For readers with access to appropriate electronic design tools, all solutions can be
developed, simulated, and synthesized as described in the book. A partial list of design topics includes design
partitioning, hierarchy decomposition, safe coding styles, back annotation, wrapper modules, concurrency,
race conditions, assertion-based verification, clock synchronization, and design for test. A concluding
presentation of special topics includes System Verilog and Verilog-AMS.
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From reader reviews:

Troy Riley:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They have to answer that question simply
because just their can do in which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A
Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute to read.

Leroy Torres:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story how
the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute, you are able to
tells your family, friends along with soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre,
make them reading a book.

Jerry Smith:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but also novel and Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A Textbook from
Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute as well as others sources were given expertise for you. After you know
how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps
students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley
Polytechnic Institute to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Dolores Mann:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A
Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute to make your personal reading is interesting. Your
personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to choose very simple
book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is to be



initial opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the reserve Digital VLSI
Design with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute can to be your brand new friend
when you're really feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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