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More than 70 original illustrations by Robert Ingpen complement the complete and unabridged text in
this edition published to celebrate the 150th anniversary of Lewis Carroll's first Alice book in
November 1865

When Alice steps through the looking-glass in the drawing room one drowsy winter afternoon, she finds
herself in a peculiar, topsy-turvy world where chess pieces walk about, flowers talk, and nothing is quite as it
seems. Alice is caught up in a bizarre chess game and encounters some rather eccentric
characters—including the argumentative Tweedledum and Tweedledee, Humpty Dumpty, the Lion and the
Unicorn, the nonsensical White Queen, and the quick-tempered Red Queen. The story features the poems,
“The Walrus and the Carpenter” and “Jabberwocky," which have become just as well known as Alice’s
adventures themselves. The award-winning artist Robert Ingpen has illustrated Lewis Carroll’s enchanting
sequel to Alice’s Adventures in Wonderland in this sumptuous volume. Full of anarchic humour, witty
rhymes, and sparkling word play, it will delight new readers and devoted Alice fans alike.
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From reader reviews:

John Lyons:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yeah, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stay than other is high. To suit your
needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Alice Through the Looking-Glass book as
beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Arthur Elsberry:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire all their reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the information about
something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there
are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their proficiency in
writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Alice Through the
Looking-Glass.

Bruce Bracey:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read will be Alice Through the Looking-Glass.

Virginia Shrader:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this book. This Alice Through the Looking-Glass is
simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have got much
space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You
can save the particular book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when
one buys this book.
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