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In 2003, 85 years after the armistice, it took Richard Rubin months to find just one living American veteran
of World War I. But then, he found another. And another. Eventually he managed to find dozens, aged 101
to 113, and interview them. All are gone now.

A decade-long odyssey to recover the story of a forgotten generation and their Great War led Rubin across
the United States and France, through archives, private collections, and battlefields, literature, propaganda,
and even music. But at the center of it all were the last of the last, the men and women he met: a new
immigrant, drafted and sent to France, whose life was saved by a horse; a Connecticut Yankee who
volunteered and fought in every major American battle; a Cajun artilleryman nearly killed by a German
aeroplane; an 18-year-old Bronx girl “drafted” to work for the War Department; a machine-gunner from
Montana; a Marine wounded at Belleau Wood; the 16-year-old who became America’s last WWI veteran;
and many, many more.

They were the final survivors of the millions who made up the American Expeditionary Forces, nineteenth-
century men and women living in the twenty-first century. Self-reliant, humble, and stoic, they kept their
stories to themselves for a lifetime, then shared them at the last possible moment, so that they, and the World
War they won – the trauma that created our modern world – might at last be remembered. You will never
forget them. The Last of the Doughboys is more than simply a war story: It is a moving meditation on
character, grace, aging, and memory.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Brown:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this particular aren't like that. This The Last of the Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and
Their Forgotten World War book is readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You will find
the facts here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving possibly decrease the
knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer associated with The Last of the Doughboys: The
Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War content conveys the thought easily to understand by a
lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different in the form of it.
So , do you nonetheless thinking The Last of the Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten
World War is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Marlon Taylor:

This The Last of the Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War are generally
reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Last of the
Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War can be one of many great books you
must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but feed anyone with information that
might be will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it all over the place and
whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Last of the Doughboys: The
Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War forcing you to have an enormous of experience such
as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day exercise. So ,
let's have it appreciate reading.

Edward Florez:

This book untitled The Last of the Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War to
be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get
a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retail store or you can order it by using
online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can
read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

James Anderson:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find book that need
more time to be read. The Last of the Doughboys: The Forgotten Generation and Their Forgotten World War
can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.
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