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The ancient, highly skilled craft of manipulating gold, silver, precious, and semi-precious stones into jewelry
is here set forth in a practical text. The authors take you through a graded series of problems, progressing
from simple to complex pieces, teaching you all you need to know along the way.
Making a pierced brooch is the first problem. You learn to affix a tracing of the design to the metal, and to
handle a center punch, saw frame and saw, needle file and flat-round file, and emery cloth. This first problem
is fully illustrated, as are all the problems, with 53 different design ideas, as well as photographs of the tools
and processes involved. Subsequent problems teach you to make brooches set with stones, chased and
repoussé brooches, wire pendants, rings with four different types of settings, chains, and cuff links.
Executing these pieces teaches you the processes of soldering, pickling, using a gas jet and blow pipe,
making a plain and shouldered bezel, annealing, enameling, making a mold for casting, and much more.
Following the section on the making of jewelry, the authors turn to a discussion of the aesthetics of jewelry
design. They suggest sources in nature and in art for creative ideas and motifs, and give helpful methods for
developing these into designs suitable for various types of jewelry pieces.
The authors, both formerly of the Rhode Island School of Design, animate every line of the text with the
knowledge that only long experience in the craft and in teaching the craft can give. For many years,
beginning and experienced crafters have kept this authoritative text beside them, using it to avoid costly
mistakes and to save many hours of trial-and-error experimentation.
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From reader reviews:

Samara Reed:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for Teachers,
Students of Design and Craft Workers book is readable through you who hate the straight word style. You
will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving possibly decrease
the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer involving Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated
Textbook for Teachers, Students of Design and Craft Workers content conveys thinking easily to understand
by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different in the form
of it. So , do you still thinking Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for Teachers, Students
of Design and Craft Workers is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Jose German:

Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for Teachers, Students of Design and Craft Workers
can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this
reserve has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every
word into joy arrangement in writing Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for Teachers,
Students of Design and Craft Workers nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the
hottest and based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one of it. This great information could
drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

William Rose:

This Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for Teachers, Students of Design and Craft
Workers is great guide for you because the content which can be full of information for you who else always
deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using
great plan word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can
have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but hard core information
with attractive delivering sentences. Having Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated Textbook for
Teachers, Students of Design and Craft Workers in your hand like having the world in your arm, info in it is
not ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen small right but
this book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt
which?

Clara Williams:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Jewelry Making and Design: An Illustrated



Textbook for Teachers, Students of Design and Craft Workers can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh
book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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