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Directors discussed include the Coen Brothers, David Lynch, Michael Mann, Christopher Nolan,
Steven Soderbergh, and Quentin Tarantino
 
A world-weary detective, a seductive femme fatale, a mysterious murder—these elements of classic film noir
live again in more recent hardboiled detective films from Chinatown to Sin City. But the themes and styles of
noir have also spilled over into contemporary films about gangsters, cops, and serial killers, such as
Reservoir Dogs, The Departed, and Se7en. New hybrid genres have been created, including psycho-noirs
such as Memento, techno-noirs such as The Matrix, and superhero noirs like The Dark Knight. Beginning by
showing how neo-noirs have drawn upon contemporary social and historical events as well as the latest
technological advances in filmmaking, this book then discusses the landmark neo-noirs, the cult auteur
figures of neo-noir, international films, and the remakes that put a new spin on past noirs. The main credits
and a plot summary are given for each movies—including Fargo, Get Carter, L.A. Confidential, Mulholland
Drive, Oldboy, and Pulp Fiction—followed by an in-depth analysis containing original insights into the
film's meaning. Also included are fascinating facts, behind-the-scenes anecdotes, and lively quotes from the
cast and crew.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Streeter:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Neo-noir (Kamera Books) is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
need in this era.

David Stokes:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Neo-noir (Kamera Books), you could
enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh
occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Betty Blake:

Beside this Neo-noir (Kamera Books) in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Neo-noir
(Kamera Books) because this book offers to you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you
rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable
set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss this? Find
this book as well as read it from currently!

Janice Wilham:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different
hobby. And also you know that little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding
something by book. Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Neo-
noir (Kamera Books).
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