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Lethal Beauty

Kimberly Renee Poole, 21, led a double life. The Winston-Salem, North Carolina area housewife and mother
was also a topless dancer at a strip club. She craved jewelry, designer clothing, and adulterous affairs with
both men and women. Brent Poole, her hopelessly devoted spouse, could deny her nothing. But that wasn't
enough for Renee. She wanted his money and his life.

Infernal Triangle

Murder moved from fantasy to reality after Renee Poole began an affair with John Boyd Frazier, a patron at
the club where she worked. On the night of June 9, 1998, on the pretext of celebrating their third wedding
anniversary, Poole lured her husband to an oceanfront hotel in Myrtle Beach, South Carolina. While their
young daughter slept in the hotel room, Renee made love to Brent on the deserted beach--then delivered him
to Frazier, who shot him dead.

American Nightmare

From the start, police knew Renee's story didn't add up, and the investigation that followed exposed the dark
details of how Brent Poole's marriage to his dream woman ended in cold blood. Author Dale Hudson's
gripping account of this high-profile case of greed, lust and murder includes extensive interviews with Renee
Poole herself, whose dance of death landed her in prison for life.

16 Pages Of Exclusive Photos

Dale Hudson is the co-author of two previous true crime books. He holds three earned masters degrees in
Psychology, Education, and Religion. He lives in Myrtle Beach, South Carolina.
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From reader reviews:

Timothy McKinney:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question
mainly because just their can do which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Dance Of Death to read.

Marilyn McDermott:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel
happy read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Dance Of Death is kind
of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Patrice Reese:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer can be Dance Of Death why because the fantastic cover that
make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely
fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this
book.

Jean McCallum:

The book untitled Dance Of Death contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with
easy means. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can
easy to read it. The book was published by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of
literary works. You can easily read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or program,
so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their
official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.
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