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Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation provides the most complete record possible of texts
from the early periods that have been translated into English, and published between 1929 and 2008. It lists
works from all genres and subjects, and includes translations wherever they have appeared across the globe.
In this annotated bibliography, Robin Healey covers over 5,200 distinct editions of pre-1900 Italian writings.
Most entries are accompanied by useful notes providing information on authors, works, translators, and how
the translations were received.

Among the works by over 1,500 authors represented in this volume are hundreds of editions by Italy's most
translated authors – Dante Alighieri, Machiavelli, and Boccaccio – and other hundreds which represent the
author's only English translation. A significant number of entries describe works originally published in
Latin. Together with Healey's Twentieth-Century Italian Literature in English Translation, this volume
makes comprehensive information on translations accessible for schools, libraries, and those interested in
comparative literature.
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From reader reviews:

Jeraldine Thurman:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important for us. The book Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto
Italian Studies) seemed to be making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The reserve Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation
(Toronto Italian Studies) is not only giving you far more new information but also to be your friend when
you truly feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make
relationship with all the book Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto Italian Studies).
You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Harriet Blum:

The e-book with title Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto Italian Studies) posesses
a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. That book
exist new understanding the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world
today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring
you throughout new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read
the item anywhere you want.

Tony Caldwell:

This Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto Italian Studies) is brand new way for you
who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this Italian
Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto Italian Studies) can be the light food for yourself
because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books produce
itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in
reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't
miss this! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.

Dwight Hancock:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
identified as of book Italian Literature before 1900 in English Translation (Toronto Italian Studies). You can
add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you
actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from
one destination to other place.
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