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Billionaire genius Genoa Greeves never got over the shocking death of her favorite teacher, Bennett "Dr.
Ben" Alston Little, murdered execution-style and stuffed into the trunk of his Mercedes-Benz. No arrests
were ever made, no killer charged for the brutal crime. Fifteen years later, the high-tech CEO reads about
another execution-style murder; this time the victim is a Hollywood music producer named Primo Ekerling.
There is no obvious connection, but the case is eerily similar to Little's and Genoa feels the time is right to
close Dr. Ben's case once and for all—offering the L.A.P.D. a substantial financial "incentive" if justice is
finally served for Little.

Lieutenant Peter Decker resents having to commit valuable manpower to a fifteen-year-old open case simply
because a rich woman says "Jump!" Still, the recent murder of Primo Ekerling does bear a disturbing
resemblance to Little's case, even though two thug suspects are currently behind bars for the Ekerling
murder. Decker can't help but wonder about a connection. His first phone calls are to the two primary
investigators in the Little case, retired detectives Calvin Vitton and Arnie Lamar. Lamar is cooperative, but
Vitton is not only reluctant to talk, he winds up dead of a suspicious suicide twelve hours later. Plunging into
this long-buried murder, Decker discovers that even though the two slayings are separated by a decade and a
half, there is still plenty of greed, lust, and evil to connect the dots.

Decker's team of top investigators not only includes his favorite homicide detectives, Scott Oliver and Marge
Dunn, but also his newly minted Hollywood detective daughter, Cindy Kutiel, whose help proves to be
invaluable. His wife, Rina Lazarus, continues to be his backbone of support, offering a cool, rational outlook
despite her growing concern for her husband's welfare and safety. Rina's worries and fears begin to build at a
fevered pitch as past and present collide with a vengeance, catapulting an unsuspecting Peter Decker closer
and closer to the edge of an infinite dark abyss.

A relentlessly gripping tale spun by a master, Faye Kellerman's The Mercedes Coffin races through a
dangerous urban world of fleeting fame and false dreams, making heart-pumping hairpin turns at each step of
a terrifying journey, where truth and justice are fine lines between life and death.
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From reader reviews:

William Hoover:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book The Mercedes Coffin LP: A Decker and
Lazarus Book will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading any book make you bored. It is not
make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Brian Griffith:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Mercedes Coffin LP: A
Decker and Lazarus Book. All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
sources or other social media.

Phillip Martin:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find book that need more time to be read.
The Mercedes Coffin LP: A Decker and Lazarus Book can be your answer given it can be read by you
actually who have those short spare time problems.

David Thompson:

As a college student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library
as well as to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and also
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this The Mercedes Coffin LP: A Decker and Lazarus Book can make you truly feel
more interested to read.
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